
BID TABULATION- BEXLEY 2025 SEWER IMPROVEMENTS
City of Bexley, Ohio- Bids Opened: May 29, 2025 1:00 p.m.

BASE BID- 2200 E. Main Sanitary Sewer Lining

1 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $10,740.00 $10,740.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

2 SS-3 Bypass Pumping LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,430.00 $4,430.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,825.00 $1,825.00

3
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 655 $8.00 $5,240.00 $5.00 $3,275.00 $9.50 $6,222.50 $8.00 $5,240.00

4 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 655 $3.00 $1,965.00 $3.00 $1,965.00 $1.00 $655.00 $4.00 $2,620.00

5 SS-10 Brick Manhole Rehabilitation VF 33 $300.00 $9,900.00 $320.00 $10,560.00 $635.00 $20,955.00 $335.00 $11,055.00

6 SS-11 Latteral Status Report LS 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $250.00 $250.00 $298.00 $298.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

7 SS-12 15" Cured in Place Pipe, 7.5 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 655 $75.00 $49,125.00 $79.00 $51,745.00 $86.00 $56,330.00 $100.00 $65,500.00

8 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

Total Base Bid $91,230.00 $82,725.00 $105,201.50 $103,440.00

Alternate Bid 1: Montrose-Euclaire Alley Sanitary Sewer Lining, LI-226 to LI-224

1 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,725.00 $1,725.00

2 SS-3 Bypass Pumping LS 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1.00 $1.00 $400.00 $400.00

3
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 620 $8.00 $4,960.00 $5.00 $3,100.00 $8.50 $5,270.00 $7.00 $4,340.00

4 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 620 $3.00 $1,860.00 $2.00 $1,240.00 $1.00 $620.00 $4.00 $2,480.00

5 SS-10 Brick Manhole Rehabilitation VF 44 $300.00 $13,200.00 $320.00 $14,080.00 $517.00 $22,748.00 $355.00 $15,620.00

6 SS-11 Latteral Status Report LS 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 $250.00 $298.00 $298.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

7 SS-12 8" Cured in Place Pipe, 6.0 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 620 $50.00 $31,000.00 $40.00 $24,800.00 $41.00 $25,420.00 $60.00 $37,200.00

8 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

Total Alternate 1 Bid $63,020.00 $48,670.00 $59,358.00 $67,965.00

ALTERNATE BID 2: Stanbery Avenue Sanitary Sewer Lining

1 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

2 SS-3 Bypass Pumping LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $1.00 $1.00 $3,425.00 $3,425.00

3
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 3021 $8.00 $24,168.00 $5.00 $15,105.00 $9.50 $28,699.50 $8.00 $24,168.00

4 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 3021 $3.00 $9,063.00 $3.00 $9,063.00 $1.00 $3,021.00 $4.00 $12,084.00

5 Spec Cutting Protruding Taps (contingency) Ea 1 $350.00 $350.00 $500.00 $500.00 $597.00 $597.00 $315.00 $315.00

6 SS-10 Brick Manhole and Inlet Rehabilitation VF 118 $300.00 $35,400.00 $345.00 $40,710.00 $358.00 $42,244.00 $335.00 $39,530.00

7 SS-11 Latteral Sewer Die Tested (Contingency) Ea. 10 $200.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $298.00 $2,980.00 $500.00 $5,000.00

8 SS-11 Latteral Status Report LS 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $298.00 $298.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

9 SS-12 8" Cured in Place Pipe, 6 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 227 $55.00 $12,485.00 $42.00 $9,534.00 $47.00 $10,669.00 $55.00 $12,485.00

10 SS-12 12" Cured in Place Pipe, 6 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 164.5 $120.00 $19,740.00 $66.00 $10,857.00 $87.00 $14,311.50 $75.00 $12,337.50

11 SS-12 15" Cured in Place Pipe, 7.5 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 2370.5 $75.00 $177,787.50 $68.00 $161,194.00 $64.00 $151,712.00 $65.00 $154,082.50

12 SS-12 18" Cured in Place Pipe, 9 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 259 $110.00 $28,490.00 $110.00 $28,490.00 $126.00 $32,634.00 $105.00 $27,195.00

13 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

Total Alternate 2 Bid $351,483.50 $345,453.00 $317,168.00 $327,822.00

ALTERNATE BID 3: Stanbery Avenue Storm Sewer Lining

1 604 Storm MH Type E for 36" Diam RCP, 11.5' depth to invert, installed in grass area, 
as per plan

Ea 2 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $31,000.00 $62,000.00 $32,772.00 $65,544.00 $21,465.00 $42,930.00

2 608 Remove and Replace Concrete Sidewalk, BEX-ST-13 SF 200 $20.00 $4,000.00 $39.00 $7,800.00 $41.00 $8,200.00 $23.00 $4,600.00

3 659 4" Topsoil, Seeding & Mulching SY 20 $20.00 $400.00 $330.00 $6,600.00 $351.00 $7,020.00 $34.50 $690.00

4 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $8,700.00 $8,700.00

5 SS-3 Bypass Pumping LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1.00 $1.00 $450.00 $450.00

6
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 2642.5 $8.00 $21,140.00 $7.00 $18,497.50 $13.50 $35,673.75 $13.00 $34,352.50

7 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 2642.5 $3.00 $7,927.50 $3.00 $7,927.50 $1.00 $2,642.50 $4.00 $10,570.00

8 Spec Cutting Protruding Taps (contingency) Ea 10 $300.00 $3,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $597.00 $5,970.00 $315.00 $3,150.00

9 Spec Large Tree Root Removal Ea 2 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $650.00 $1,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $380.00 $760.00

10 SS-10 Brick Manhole and Inlet Rehabilitation VF 69.3 $300.00 $20,790.00 $363.00 $25,155.90 $409.00 $28,343.70 $335.00 $23,215.50

11 SS-11 Latteral Status Report LS 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $298.00 $298.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

12 SS-12 36" Cured in Place Pipe, 18 mm (minimum) Thickness LF 2642.5 $250.00 $660,625.00 $277.00 $731,972.50 $245.00 $647,412.50 $280.00 $739,900.00

13 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

Total Alternate 3 Bid $832,882.50 $937,753.40 $882,505.45 $920,518.00

Inliner Solutions, LLC

Hilliard, Ohio 43026
(614) 529-6440

4143 Weaver Court
Ref. 
No.

Item 
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Visu-Sewer of Ohio, LLC
6508 Taylor Road SW

Reynoldsburg, OH 43068
(614) 575-0065

Insituform Technologies, LLC

Chesterfield, MO 63005
(636) 530-8000

17988 Edison Avenue

Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item TotalUnit Price Item Total



OPTIONAL BID 1: STORM SEWER GROUTING BID: Stanbery Avenue Storm Sewer Grouting (Option replaces Alternate Bid 3)

1 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

2 SS-3 Bypass Pumping LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $500.00 $500.00

3
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 2642.5 $9.00 $23,782.50 $5.20 $13,741.00

4 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 2642.5 $3.00 $7,927.50 $3.00 $7,927.50

5 SS-10 Brick Manhole and Inlet Rehabilitation VF 69.3 $300.00 $20,790.00 $363.00 $25,155.90

6 SS-11 Latteral Status Report LS 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

7 Spec Testing of 36" Pipe Joints Joint 660 $175.00 $115,500.00 $190.00 $125,400.00

8 Spec Grouting 36" Pipe Joints, 18.0 gal/joint typical Joint 660 $200.00 $132,000.00 $216.00 $142,560.00

9 Spec Cutting Protruding Taps (contingency) Ea. 10 $750.00 $7,500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00

10 Spec Large Tree Root Removal Ea 2 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $650.00 $1,300.00

11 Spec Post Construction CCTV Inspection LF 2642.5 $5.00 $13,212.50 $3.50 $9,248.75

12 Spec Warranty CCTV Inspection of  pipes grouted LF 2642.5 $9.00 $23,782.50 $25.00 $66,062.50

13 Spec Increase/Decrease in gallons of grout required  from typical, Contingency Gal 2000 $10.00 $20,000.00 $12.00 $24,000.00

14 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

Storm Sewer Grouting Stanbery Avenue Bid Total: $419,495.00 $455,895.65 No Bid No Bid

OPTIONAL BID 2: STORM SEWER GROUTING BID: Library Alley, South of Main Street, 60" Storm Sewer Grouting

1 614 Maintenance of Traffic LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

2 SS-3 Bypass Pumping (Contingency) LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $500.00

3
SS-4/ SS-
5 Sewer Cleaning and Pre Video Recording Inspection LF 360 $15.00 $5,400.00 $12.00 $4,320.00

4 SS-4 Heavy Cleaning (contingency) LF 360 $5.00 $1,800.00 $3.00 $1,080.00

5 Spec Testing of 60" Pipe Joints Joint 50 $1,000.00 $50,000.00 $1,240.00 $62,000.00

6 Spec Grouting 60" Pipe Joints, 40.0 gal/joint typical Joint 50 $400.00 $20,000.00 $480.00 $24,000.00

7 Spec Post Construction CCTV Inspection LF 360 $5.00 $1,800.00 $8.00 $2,880.00

8 Spec Increase/Decrease in gallons of grout required  from typical, Contingency Gal 400 $10.00 $4,000.00 $12.00 $4,800.00

9 Spec Force Account Contingency LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

Storm Sewer Grouting Library Alley, South of Main Street 60" Bid Total: $98,000.00 $109,580.00 No Bid No Bid

Total Base Bid $91,230.00 $82,725.00 -9.3% $105,201.50 15.3% $103,440.00 13.4%

Total Base + Alt 1 Bid $154,250.00 $131,395.00 -14.8% $164,559.50 6.7% $171,405.00 11.1%

Total Base + Alt 1 + Alt 2 Bid $505,733.50 $476,848.00 -5.7% $481,727.50 -4.7% $499,227.00 -1.3%

Total Base + Alt 1 + Alt 2+ Alt 3 Bid $1,338,616.00 $1,414,601.40 5.7% $1,364,232.95 1.9% $1,419,745.00 6.1%

Total Base + Alt 1 +Alt 2+ Optional Bid 1 $925,228.50 $932,743.65 0.8% No Bid on Optional Bid 1 No Bid on Optional Bid 1

Total Base + Alt 1 +Alt 2+ Optional Bid 1+ Optional Bid 2 $1,023,228.50 $1,042,323.65 1.9% No Bid on Optional Bid 2 No Bid on Optional Bid 2

Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

Ref. 
No.

Item 
No.

 Description Unit Quantity
Engineer's Estimate

Visu-Sewer of Ohio, LLC Insituform Technologies, LLC

(614) 575-0065 (636) 530-8000

6508 Taylor Road SW 17988 Edison Avenue
Reynoldsburg, OH 43068 Chesterfield, MO 63005

17988 Edison Avenue
Insituform Technologies, LLC

(636) 530-8000
Chesterfield, MO 63005



Campaign Contributions Affidavit Completed
Bid Addendum Acknowledged

Ohio DAS EEO Certificate No
No
Yes

No
Yes

Ohio DAS EEO Edge Sub-Contractors 5% Goal No-Waiver Requested

All required documents submitted Yes YesYes
YesProposal Completed Correctly Yes Yes

Visu-Sewer of Ohio, LLCContractor: Insituform Technologies, LLC Inliner Solutions, LLC

Price for labor and material stated separately Yes Yes
All spaces filled in properly Yes YesYes

Yes

Non-collusion Affidavit Completed Yes Yes
Total Price Checked Yes NoYes

Yes
Corporation Affidavit Completed (if applicable) N/A YesN/A

Yes
Auditor of State- Unresolved Findings for Recovery Certified Search Completed Did Not Perform Check Did Not Perform Check

Affidavit of Personal Property Tax Liability Completed Yes Yes
Yes

Sub-Contractors List Included Yes Yes
Detailed Statement of Qualifications Included Yes Yes
Bid Guaranty and Contract Bond Completed Yes YesYes

Yes
Yes

Yes
N/A

Amount of Bid

 SiriusPoint America Insurance Company 
A.M. Best Rating A+A+

 Everest Reinsurance Company Bonding Agency
 Travelers Casualty and Surety Co of 

America 

Yes Yes
Yes Yes

Bond Amount 1,364,232.95 Amount of Bid

A+


