
BID TABULATION- 2023 STREET IMPROVEMENTS- CONTRACT A & B
City of Bexley, Ohio- Bids Opened: April 11, 2023, 11:00 a.m.

 CONTRACT A- ASPHALT PAVEMENT 

1 203 Asphalt Base Replacement w/ 448 T2 Asphalt as Directed C.Y. 95 $500.00 $47,500.00 $805.15 $76,489.25 $480.00 $45,600.00 $505.00 $47,975.00

2 203 Pavement Planing S.Y. 13,303 $3.50 $46,560.50 $2.14 $28,468.42 $4.00 $53,212.00 $6.00 $79,818.00

3 204 Proof Rolling (Contingency) Hour 5 $80.00 $400.00 $125.00 $625.00 $100.00 $500.00 $150.00 $750.00

4 252 Remove and Replace 6"-8" thick Concrete Drive Approach, Per BEX-ST-03 S.Y. 120 $140.00 $16,800.00 $129.17 $15,500.40 $180.00 $21,600.00 $108.00 $12,960.00

5 252 Asphalt Driveway Pavement Replacement, Type IIIA Per BEX-UT-05 S.Y. 30 $120.00 $3,600.00 $152.71 $4,581.30 $170.00 $5,100.00 $118.00 $3,540.00

6 SS 1510Sami-Seal w/ Polymerized Binder S.Y. 11,295 $4.00 $45,180.00 $4.40 $49,698.00 $4.35 $49,133.25 $5.00 $56,475.00

7 407 Tack Coat- Trackless Tack Gal. 390 $5.00 $1,950.00 $4.50 $1,755.00 $4.00 $1,560.00 $4.15 $1,618.50

8 441 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1, (448) PG 64-22 Tons 1,176 $130.00 $152,880.00 $131.76 $154,949.76 $145.00 $170,520.00 $190.00 $223,440.00

9 604 Curb Inlet Reconstructed to Grade (Contingency Ea. 4 $750.00 $3,000.00 $2,353.44 $9,413.76 $950.00 $3,800.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00

10 605 3" Roof Drain Reconnect thru Curb LF 75 $20.00 $1,500.00 $35.18 $2,638.50 $20.00 $1,500.00 $15.00 $1,125.00

11 605 4" Underdrain Pipe for continuous curb replacment L.F. 980 $13.00 $12,740.00 $13.39 $13,122.20 $16.00 $15,680.00 $13.50 $13,230.00

12 608 Detectable Warning- Armortile Wet Set 2'x 4', Red Ea. 10 $250.00 $2,500.00 $556.92 $5,569.20 $250.00 $2,500.00 $250.00 $2,500.00

13 608 Remove and Replace Concrete Curb Ramps, Sidewalk and Lead Walks S.F. 1,900 $14.00 $26,600.00 $14.64 $27,816.00 $20.00 $38,000.00 $11.55 $21,945.00

14 609
Remove and Replace Concrete Curb and Gutter (Spot Work), Per BEX-ST-
09 Including Asphalt Pavement Repair in front of new curb L.F. 350 $50.00 $17,500.00 $54.92 $19,222.00 $80.00 $28,000.00 $42.00 $14,700.00

15 609
Remove and Replace Concrete Curb and Gutter (Continuous), Per BEX-ST-
08 Including Asphalt Pavement Repair in front of new curb L.F. 980 $50.00 $49,000.00 $46.41 $45,481.80 $58.00 $56,840.00 $27.83 $27,273.40

16 644 Parking Lines, 4" White L.F. 120 $3.00 $360.00 $3.67 $440.40 $3.50 $420.00 $5.27 $632.40

17 644 Stop Bars, 20" White L.F. 129 $12.00 $1,548.00 $11.02 $1,421.58 $10.50 $1,354.50 $15.80 $2,038.20

18 644 Crosswalks, 12" White L.F. 490 $6.00 $2,940.00 $4.72 $2,312.80 $4.50 $2,205.00 $6.77 $3,317.30

19 644 Double Yellow Centerline L.F. 240 $4.00 $960.00 $4.20 $1,008.00 $4.00 $960.00 $6.02 $1,444.80

20 644 Word "SCHOOL" Ea. 1 $800.00 $800.00 $876.75 $876.75 $835.00 $835.00 $1,256.33 $1,256.33

21 251
Partial Depth Asphalt Pavement Repair, 2.0" thick, Spot Work, Various 
Locations throughout Bexley, as directed, 5 SY Minimum Area S.Y. 600 $65.00 $39,000.00 $63.89 $38,334.00 $68.00 $40,800.00 $72.50 $43,500.00

22 604 MH adjusted to grade (contingency) Ea. 7 $500.00 $3,500.00 $350.00 $2,450.00 $750.00 $5,250.00 $500.00 $3,500.00

23 638 Water Valve adjusted to grade (contingency) Ea. 7 $200.00 $1,400.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $325.00 $2,275.00 $500.00 $3,500.00

24 659 4" Topsoil, Seeding & Mulching (Including Excavation) S.Y. 340 $20.00 $6,800.00 $15.00 $5,100.00 $36.00 $12,240.00 $22.00 $7,480.00

Force Account Contingency

25 Spec. Force Account L.S. 1 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

ITEMIZED TOTAL= $505,018.50 $529,374.12 $579,884.75 $598,818.93 No Bid

 CONTRACT B- BRICK PAVEMENT REPAIR 

1 203
Removal of Unsuitable Base and Replacement w/ 305 Concrete 
Base(Contingency) C.Y. 5 600.00 $3,000.00 $900.00 $4,500.00

2 Spec.
Remove and Relay Brick Pavers on No. 9 Limestone/Cement Bedding, Spot 
Work as directed S.Y. 600 90.00 $54,000.00 $94.20 $56,520.00

3 Spec.
Furnish Replacement Bricks, Kiln Fired Clay, 4" x 8" x 3" thick, reclaimed to 
match existing Ea. 2,000 2.00 $4,000.00 $2.40 $4,800.00

Force Account Contingency

4 Spec. Force Account L.S. 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

$66,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $70,820.00

Engineer's Estimate Rank Decker Construction Rank CAP-STONE & Associates, Inc. Rank Strawser Paving Company Rank Midwest Landscape, Inc.

Contract A Bid Total $505,018.50 1 $529,374.12 2 $579,884.75 3 $598,818.93 No Bid

Percent above/below Estimate 4.8% 14.8% 3.3%

Contract B Bid Total $66,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 $70,820.00

Percent above/below Estimate 7.3%

David B Koch, PE

Midwest Landscape, Inc.
3450 E. 7th Ave.

Columbus, Ohio 43219
614-989-0697

Unit Price Item Total

(614) 488-7958 (614) 759-9800 (614) 276-5273

3040 McKinley Avenue 5715 Westbourne Ave 1595 Frank Road
Strawser Paving Company

Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

Ref. 
No.

Item 
No.

 Description Unit Quantity
Engineer's Estimate

Unit Price Item Total

Columbus, Ohio 43223

Unit Price Item Total

Decker Construction CAP-STONE & Associates, Inc.

Columbus, Ohio 43204 Columbus, Ohio 43213
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11
11 EDGE 5% Goal  Provided
12 Campaign Contributions Affidavit Completed
13 EEO Certificate of Compliance from ODAS
4b Bid Addendums Acknowledged

No No MS Trucking, 7% of Bid Waiver Requested

West Bend Mutual Insurance Co

Midwest Landscape, Inc.
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Amount of Bid

Bonding Agency Cincinnati Insurance Company Ohio Farmers Insurance Company

Sub-Contractors List Included Yes Yes Yes

Yes
Detailed Statement of Qualifications Included Yes Yes Yes
Bid Guaranty and Contract Bond Completed Yes Yes

Yes

A.M. Best Rating A

Yes

Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland 

Yes Yes

Yes Yes
Bond Amount Amount of Bid Amount of Bid Amount of Bid

Yes
YesYes No

Non-collusion Affidavit Completed Yes Yes Yes
Total Price Checked Yes Yes Yes- Contract A, No- Contract B

Auditor of State- Unresolved Findings for Recovery Certified Search Completed Yes Did Not Perform Check
Affidavit of Personal Property Tax Liability Completed Yes Yes Yes

Corporation Affidavit Completed (if applicable) Yes Yes Yes

Did Not Perform Check

Proposal Completed Correctly Yes Yes Yes
All required documents submitted Yes Yes Yes

Price for labor and material stated separately Yes Yes Yes
All spaces filled in properly Yes Yes Yes

Contractor: Decker Construction CAP-STONE & Associates, Inc. Strawser Paving Company


